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The Ohio River Valley Series is a professional baseball league that has
been operating since 1949. The league is composed of teams from Ohio,
Kentucky, Indiana, and West Virginia. The Showboat is the league's
championship trophy, and it is awarded to the team that wins the league
championship series.

The ORVS is one of the oldest and most respected minor leagues in the
United States. The league has a rich history, and many of its former players
have gone on to successful careers in Major League Baseball. Some of the
most notable ORVS alumni include Hank Aaron, Willie Mays, and Ken
Griffey Jr.

The ORVS is a great place to watch exciting baseball and see some of the
best up-and-coming talent in the country. The league's teams are located in
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small towns and cities throughout the Ohio River Valley, and the games are
always well-attended by passionate fans.

The Showboat

The Showboat is the championship trophy of the Ohio River Valley Series.
The trophy is a silver replica of a showboat, and it is awarded to the team
that wins the league championship series.

The Showboat was first awarded in 1949, and it has been won by some of
the most legendary teams in ORVS history. Some of the most notable
Showboat winners include the Portsmouth RedBirds, the Ashland A's, and
the Evansville Otters.

The Showboat is a symbol of excellence in the Ohio River Valley Series. It
is a coveted trophy, and it is a testament to the hard work and dedication of
the teams that have won it.

The Teams

The Ohio River Valley Series is composed of 12 teams, which are divided
into two divisions: the East Division and the West Division.

The East Division teams are the Ashland A's, the Chillicothe Paints, the
Dayton Dragons, the Florence Y'alls, the Lexington Legends, and the
Washington Wild Things.

The West Division teams are the Evansville Otters, the Florence Freedom,
the Gateway Grizzlies, the Joliet Slammers, the Southern Illinois Miners,
and the Traverse City Beach Bums.



The teams in the ORVS play a 96-game regular season, which runs from
May to September. The top two teams in each division qualify for the
league championship series, which is a best-of-five series.

The Fans

The Ohio River Valley Series is a popular league with passionate fans. The
league's games are always well-attended, and the fans are known for their
enthusiastic support.

The fans of the ORVS come from all walks of life. They are young and old,
men and women, and they all share a love of baseball. The fans of the
ORVS are what make the league so special, and they are the reason why
the league has been so successful for over 70 years.

The Ohio River Valley Series is a great place to watch exciting baseball
and see some of the best up-and-coming talent in the country. The league's
teams are located in small towns and cities throughout the Ohio River
Valley, and the games are always well-attended by passionate fans.

The Ohio River Valley Series is a unique and special league, and it is a
great way to experience the American pastime.
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